

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	1	2	3	4	5	6	7	8	9	10	11	12
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Bass Clarinet Selmer	Clarinet YCL 200	Clarinet 450 N	Flute YFL 382	Oboe YOB-441	Flute 800B	Standard Bb Clarinet YCL-255	Standard Flute Offset G C-Foot	Piccolo JPC700	Bass Clarinet 7168	Piccolo YPC-32	Piccolo YPC-62
ALAMO MUSIC	\$1,807.00	\$344.52	\$831.30	\$801.85	\$2,543.20	NB	\$430.40	\$409.50	\$571.00	\$1,838.00	\$588.10	\$1,529.55
ALTO MUSIC	\$2,166.92	\$437.00	\$874.00	\$842.00	\$2,897.00	NB	\$451.00	\$429.00	NB	\$2,163.95	\$617.00	\$1,561.00
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$1,850.98	\$469.00	\$875.00	\$845.00	\$2,999.00	\$1,079.99	\$453.00	\$430.00	\$599.99	\$1,887.00	\$618.00	\$1,608.00
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
TAYLOR MUSIC	\$1,777.00	377.00 ALT	\$717.00	\$833.00	\$2,595.00	NB	\$377.00	\$366.00	\$535.00	\$1,790.00	\$606.00	\$1,566.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY	\$1,870.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$1,871.00	NB	NB
WASHINGTON MUSIC	\$1,863.95	\$369.30	\$831.90	\$802.40	\$2,547.05	\$1,087.55	\$369.30	\$351.35	\$538.30	\$1,899.80	\$588.25	\$1,531.45

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	13	14	15	16	17	18	19	20	21	22	23	24
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Piccolo W/ Case Model 307	Contra bass Clarinet Model 7182	Bb Clarinet R13	Oboe YOB-841	Clarinet YCL-650	Trumpet YTR 4335 G11	Alto Saxophone YA S-480 AS	Saxophone Eas 251	Tuba EBB234	Trombone YSL - 354	Tuba EBC832	French Horn 8D
ALAMO MUSIC	\$558.00	\$4,768.00	\$5,291.00	\$5,370.40	\$1,375.65	\$1,115.35	\$1,764.20	NB	NB	\$770.50	NB	\$4,178.00
ALTO MUSIC	NB	\$5,624.04	NB	\$5,651.00	\$1,446.00	\$1,172.00	\$1,855.00	\$1,940.00	NB	740.00S 609.00G	NB	\$3,979.93
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$574.00	\$4,852.89	\$3,728.00	\$5,652.00	\$1,447.00	\$1,073.00	\$1,856.00	\$669.00	\$1,999.99	\$610.00	\$4,699.99	\$3,977.00
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	\$3,320.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
TAYLOR MUSIC	NB	\$4,666.00	\$2,844.00	\$6,199.00	\$1,411.00	\$1,159.00	\$1,811.00	NB	NB	705.00S 505.00G	NB	\$3,788.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY	NB	\$4,861.00	\$3,162.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$3,985.00
WASHINGTON MUSIC	\$578.15	\$4,886.90	2942.70ALT	\$6,068.75	\$1,377.30	\$1,116.50	\$1,766.55	NB	NB	661.80S 498.40G	NB	\$4,245.30

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB  
instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	25	26	27	28	29	30	31	32	33	34	35	36
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Mellophone JMP1101M	Sousaphone JSP1010	Tuba EBB226	Trumpet YTR-2330	Tuba EBB231	Euphonium EEP321	Trumpet Bb 390	Trumpet ETR420	Alto Saxophone YAS-26	Sousaphone 2350	Tenor Sax LaBrava 200	Bari Sax 200B
ALAMO MUSIC	\$1,483.00	\$3,757.00	NB	\$580.50	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$1,046.95	\$5,698.00	\$2,028.00	\$4,148.00
ALTO MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	\$487.00	\$4,431.20	\$2,570.00	\$1,185.00	\$1,194.00	\$853.40	\$7,720.05	\$1,849.50	\$4,108.26
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$1,499.00	\$4,116.33	\$2,839.99	\$629.00	\$1,939.99	\$849.99	NB	\$369.99	\$1,100.00	\$5,678.00	\$1,899.00	\$3,999.00
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	1800.00 ALT RS BARTELEY TSS536	3500.00 ALT RS BARTELEY RSS509
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$1,845.00	\$3,830.00
TAYLOR MUSIC	\$1,380.00	4066.00S 3626.00L	NB	\$505.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$899.00	\$5,933.00	NB	NB
UNIVERSAL MELODY	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$5,810.00	NB	NB
WASHINGTON MUSIC	\$1,385.30	4107.30 S 3661.90 L	NB	\$498.40	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$899.55	\$5,717.85	\$1,868.70	\$3,822.50
												5% win

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB  
instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	37	38	39	40	41	42	43	44	45	46	47	48
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Trumpet YTR-2330	Double Horn YHR- 671	French Horn YHR- 32211	Mellophone YMP-204M	Marching Baritone YBH-301M	Baritone Sax YBS- 480	Sousaphone YSH-411	Tuba EBB534	Sousaphone 2350WSP	Euphonium YEP-321S	Marching Baritone EMB411S	Sousaphone EPH495S
ALAMO MUSIC	\$675.50	\$3,668.95	\$1,602.70	\$1,363.30	\$1,909.55	\$4,312.10	\$7,145.00	NB	\$7,298.00	\$2,037.80	NB	NB
ALTO MUSIC	\$709.00	\$3,860.00	\$1,685.00	\$1,314.00	\$1,934.84	\$4,855.66	\$8,046.40	\$7,423.00	\$8,883.58	\$2,143.00	\$2,511.95	\$7,369.60
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$710.00	\$3,642.00	\$1,686.00	\$1,434.00	\$2,009.00	\$4,538.00	\$7,520.00	NB	\$7,159.00	\$2,144.00	\$1,149.99	\$4,149.99
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
TAYLOR MUSIC	\$595.00	3711.00 L	\$1,644.00	\$1,388.00	\$1,933.00	\$4,366.00	\$7,266.00	NB	\$6,999.00	\$2,066.00	NB	NB
UNIVERSAL MELODY	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$7,473.00	NB	NB	NB
WASHINGTON MUSIC	\$580.10	NB	\$1,604.75	\$1,364.90	\$1,912.20	\$4,319.30	\$7,157.60	NB	\$7,209.35	\$2,040.70	NB	NB

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB  
instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	49	50	51	52	53	54	55	56	57	58	59	60
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Mellophone EMP304S	French Horn YHR- 668NII	Baritone Saxophone PMB-302	Alto Saxophone System 76	Soprano Saxophone System 76	Alto Sax YAS-62III	Trumpet YTR-6335	Trombone YSL-620	Concert Bass Drum Stand PEA- STBD36F	Concert Bass Drum PEA- PBA3616	Trap Table GIB-7615	Rolling Bell Stand & Accessory Trap Table
ALAMO MUSIC	NB	\$3,668.95	\$4,638.00	NB	\$2,258.00	\$2,283.85	\$1,654.00	\$1,637.85	\$662.00	\$1,514.00	\$171.00	\$308.00
ALTO MUSIC	\$1,469.60	\$3,860.00	\$4,974.96	\$2,261.89	\$2,120.49	\$2,402.00	\$1,739.00	\$1,731.00	\$685.87	\$1,665.99	\$102.71	NB
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$869.99	\$3,861.00	\$4,699.00	\$2,299.00	\$2,149.00	\$2,403.00	\$1,740.00	\$1,723.00	\$699.00	\$1,657.00	NB	NB
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	3500.00 ALT	1800.00 ALT	\$2,900.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$190.00	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	\$4,635.00	\$2,235.00	\$2,098.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
					5% win							
TAYLOR MUSIC	NB	\$3,711.00	\$4,222.00	\$2,022.00	\$2,133.00	\$2,333.00	\$1,699.00	\$1,666.00	\$603.00	\$1,466.00	NB	\$299.00
UNIVERSAL MELODY	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$675.00	\$2,298.00	NB	NB
WASHINGTON MUSIC	NB	\$3,674.95	\$4,607.40	\$2,231.30	\$2,085.45	\$2,287.20	\$1,656.15	\$1,640.00	\$609.55	\$1,480.60	\$150.30	\$309.40

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB  
instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	61	62	63	64	65	66	67	68	69	70	71	72
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Xylophone Kit 2.5 Octave w/Pad,	SKB Large Drum Hardware Case	3-Octave Xylophone w/Stand Standard	Marimba	Marching Snare Drum	Cymbal Pair	Mallet Pack	Snare Drum Carrier	Concert Bells with Damper	Glockenspiel	Bass Drum	Base Podium
ALAMO MUSIC	NB	\$226.00	\$814.00	\$4,998.00	NB	\$342.00	\$274.00	NB	NB	\$2,213.00	\$2,148.00	NB
ALTO MUSIC	\$754.39	\$195.72	\$877.40	\$6,053.45	\$428.19	\$353.19	\$237.49	\$260.59	\$3,713.97	\$2,099.95	\$2,341.16	\$623.00
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$587.00	NB	\$899.00	\$4,527.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$3,559.00	NB	\$2,288.00	NB
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$590.00	\$250.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
TAYLOR MUSIC	\$588.00	NB	NB	\$4,444.00	\$577.00	\$366.00	\$239.00	\$272.00	\$3,333.00	NB	\$2,060.00	NB
UNIVERSAL MELODY	\$616.00	\$225.00	NB	\$5,092.00	\$884.00	\$358.68	\$211.32	\$287.00	NB	NB	\$2,298.00	NB
WASHINGTON MUSIC	\$563.30	\$274.00	\$780.50	\$4,559.30	\$582.00	\$384.15	\$274.20	\$244.50	\$3,303.75	\$1,808.35	\$2,080.65	NB

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	73	74	75	76	77	78	79	80	81	82	83
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Percussion Cabinet	Microphone	headphone splitter	Amplifier	Microphone	Speaker	Guitar Amp	Clarinet Mouthpiece M30	Clarinet Mouthpiece B45	Trombone Mouthpiece 51D	Tuba Mouthpiece
ALAMO MUSIC	NB	\$1,098.00	\$47.00	\$798.00	\$205.00	NB	NB	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$89.25	\$142.75
ALTO MUSIC	\$1,320.00	\$794.80	\$24.50	\$774.80	\$76.75	NB	\$548.79	\$90.38	\$90.38	\$48.00	\$59.57
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	\$1,799.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	\$1,150.00	\$25.00	\$1,050.00	\$200.00	NB	\$700.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
			5% win								
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
TAYLOR MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	77.99 ALT	77.99 ALT	\$64.99	\$63.99
UNIVERSAL MELODY	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	93.00 ALT	93.00 ALT	80.00 ALT	\$93.00
WASHINGTON MUSIC	NB	\$1,169.00	NB	\$870.15	\$191.10	NB	574.55 ?	\$75.80	\$75.80	\$70.20	\$57.15

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB instrument

Green 5% local preference

BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	84	85	86	87	88	89	90	91	92	93	94	95
<b>BIDDERS</b>	Tuner	Mic Cable	12 Channel Mixer	PA System	Mouthpiece M13	Mouthpiece S80C	Sound System	StudioLive AR16c USB-C 18-Channel	Enclosed Synth Cart	Band/Orchestra Folio Cabinet	Instrumental Music Folder Custom	Finale Music Notation Program
ALAMO MUSIC	\$18.48	\$16.98	NB	\$694.00	\$85.00	\$363.00	\$598.00	\$738.00	\$2,794.00	NB	NB	NB
ALTO MUSIC	\$10.27	\$14.99	\$245.03	\$1,447.95	\$105.84	\$185.84	\$548.80	\$521.42	\$3,145.00	\$1,084.00	\$12.95	\$215.00
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	\$1,499.00	NB	NB
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	\$16.00	\$15.00	\$330.00	\$1,200.00	NB	NB	1200.00 ALT	\$700.00	NB	NB	NB	NB
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
TAYLOR MUSIC	\$13.99	\$11.99	NB	NB	83.99 ALT	144.99 ALT	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
UNIVERSAL MELODY	\$13.00	\$12.00	NB	NB	\$90.00	\$166.00	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB	NB
WASHINGTON MUSIC	\$14.90	\$11.45	\$337.75	NB	\$81.25	\$145.80	\$750.35	\$677.80	\$2,543.40	NB	NB	NB

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB instrument

Green 5% local preference



BID REQUEST 22-07 - BAND INSTRUMENTS, EQUIPMENT, ETC. BID TABULATION FORM

	96	97	98	
<b>BIDDERS</b>	NotePerformer 3.1 Lab Pack (5)	PreSonus AudioBox 96 Ultimate	Service/Repair/Refur per hr	<b>GRAND TOTAL</b>
ALAMO MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	
ALTO MUSIC	\$134.91	\$233.32	\$25.00	
ART'S MUSIC SHOP	NB	NB	NB	
K & S MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	
LEITZ MUSIC / 5% LP	NB	\$330.00	NB	
MRW ARTISAN / 5% LP	NB	NB	\$80.00	
TAYLOR MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	
UNIVERSAL MELODY	NB	NB	NB	
WASHINGTON MUSIC	NB	NB	NB	

Key:

Pink Awarded

NB = NO BID

Yellow under item SUB instrument

Green 5% local preference